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9787564063658 INSPECTION PRACTICES(CHINESE EDITION)

paperback. Book Condition: New. Ship out in 2 business day, And Fast shipping, Free Tracking number will be
provided aFer the shipment.Paperback. Pub Date :2012-08-01 Pages: 269 Publisher: Beijing Institute of
Technology Press title: inspection of Practice List Price: 44.00 yuan Author: Zheng Huiying. CAO Xiao-Press:
Beijing Institute of Technology Press Publication Date: 2012 - 08-01ISBN: 9787564063658 the number of words:
Page: 269 Revision: 1 Format: Folio: 16 Weight: Editor's Summary inspection practices editors have years of
inspection. customs and foreign trade of actual work experience. has many years of inspection teaching
experience qualifying examination and inspection staK training experience. They respond positively to the new
concept of national education project teaching applied to the inspection course in teaching first-line first try.
Practice for inspection inspection of Practice is divided into eight projects need to design several modules. each
project in accordance with the actual business of the inspection. there are certain inherent knowledge of
contact between the module and the module. a total of 23 tasks. each task self-contained . mainly composed
the task description + Operations Guide + Demo + independent practical operation (ie what + how + to teach
you to do + you do) composed of four parts. Inspection of Practice written inspection staK qualification
examination syllabus closely based unified national examination materials inspection staK qualifications to the
Standards Press of China. combined with the examination of the perfect combination of inspection staK over
the years and previous inspection teaching comprehensive literature and web resources The comprehensive.
highlighting the key and diKicult practice with the candidate. and strive to achieve the textbooks and
examinations. project teaching seamless connection. Directory project an understanding of Entry-Exit
Inspection and Quarantine task recognizes two understanding of inspection units and inspection staK tasks of
the entry-exit inspection and quarantine project inspection...
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Thomas Nelson Inc. BOARD BOOK. Book Condition: New. 0849914833 Brand new in the
original wrap- I ship FAST via USPS first class mail 2-3 day transit with FREE tracking!!.
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